
WELCOME DRINK
Includes choice of prosecco, 
wine, cans of beer (based on 1PP)

TREAT YOUR GUESTS
Pre-loaded QR code for your 
guests to spend on drinks only. 
An average of 4 further standard 
drinks.

Pre-loaded QR code for your 
guests to spend on £20 on street 
food: allowing for 1 main and 1 
side or 1 desert.

SIT BACK AND RELAX
Designated space for your party. 
All adiministration and event 
planning.

BRIDGE OVER BUBBLED WATER

£55 PER PERSON

WELCOME DRINK
Includes choice of prosecco, 
wine, cans of beer (based on 1PP)

TREAT YOUR GUESTS
Pre-loaded QR code for your 
guests to spend on drinks only. 
An average of 6 further standard 
drinks.

Pre-loaded QR code for your 
guests to spend on £20 on street 
food: allowing for 1 main and 1 
side or 1 desert.

SIT BACK AND RELAX
Designated space for your party. 
All adiministration and event 
planning.

SHORE STOPPER
£75 PER PERSON

WELCOME DRINK
Includes choice of prosecco, 
wine, cans of beer (based on 1PP)

TREAT YOUR GUESTS
Pre-loaded QR code for your 
guests to spend on drinks only. 
An average of 4 further 
standard drinks.

SIT BACK AND RELAX
Designated space for your party. 
All adiministration and event 
planning.

NEW KIDS ON THE DOCK
£35 PER PERSON

PACKAGES


